


90 Days to Riches Action Plan 
 

www.einvestingforbeginners.com 2 
 

The 90 Days to Riches 
Action Plan (eCourse pt. 2) 
I’ve pounded the table about this and will keep 
pounding.  
 
You can’t learn from watching. You can’t learn 
from reading. You need to learn by doing. 
 
It’s ok to make mistakes. You should expect to 
make mistakes. Nobody is perfect on their first 
try. 
 
That’s why I recommend starting small. Buy just 
one share of a stock. Watch it, then slowly buy 
more. 
 
Make rookie mistakes while the money amounts 
are small. If more people did this there would be 
fewer and fewer stories of people losing it all. 
 
You’ll look back in 90 days and be shocked with 
how much you’ve learned. 
 
Investing takes time to absorb. There’s no magic 
pill to success. It doesn’t come to those who wait. 
Intimidating, sure.  Impossible? Never.  

I’ll show you how easy it is to buy a stock from a 
broker. Then there’s no excuses. 
 
The best online broker I can recommend for 
buying your first stock is TradeKing.  
 
This broker is one of the few who don’t require a 
minimum initial deposit. Most brokers want $500 
or more. 
 
Plus they only charge $4.95 per trade compared 
to most at $6.95 or $9.95.  
 
See for yourself. 
 
Firstrade 
$6.95 stock trades 
No account minimum 
 
ETrade 
$9.95 stock trades 
Account Minimum: $500 
  
TradeKing 
$4.95 stock trades 
No account minimum 
 
Pick the broker you are most comfortable with, 
then let’s move on. I use TradeKing.  

http://www.kqzyfj.com/click-7095369-10979436
http://www.kqzyfj.com/click-7095369-10476647
http://www.dpbolvw.net/click-7095369-11279514
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4 Easy Steps to Buy a Stock 
1. From the home page, highlight the “Trading” 
tab and then select Stocks/ETFs -> Regular Hours 
Trading. 

 

2. Next, fill out the information with the number 
of shares you want, the stock ticker, and also 
select Market for a regular buy. 

 

3. Review the information and make sure you 
didn’t make any mistakes 

 

4. That’s it! Congratulations, you’ve just bought 
your first stock. 

 

For all the complexity of the markets and Wall 
Street, buying a stock itself sure is easy. 

Many people don’t know that. It’s a shame.  
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I hope I’ve made it as easy as possible for you to 
jump into the markets.  
 
With today’s economic conditions, you can’t just 
let your cash sit under your mattress. 
 
Everyday your money isn’t invested is a day you 
are losing to inflation. Stop fighting the forces in 
this world. Side with them instead. 
 
Become friends with time instead of enemies, and 
watch as the magic of compounding interest 
grows your capital. 
 
More and more investors are taking control of 
their own investments. 
 
They are learning how to invest intelligently. 
 
It isn’t that hard. But so many people are just too 
lazy or too trusting. You work so hard for your 
money, why not spend some time to protect it? 
 
I’m glad for your sake that you’ve decided to take 
this eCourse. I can’t know if you will take action 
like I’ve been pleading, but I hope you do. 
 
There’s one last step to the eCourse, and it 
involves an opportunity to speak with me for a 

short interview over Skype. 
 
I can’t promise that I’ll be able to offer this 
service in the future.  
 
Take advantage while you can.  
 
Zig Ziglar had a great quote once, “You can have 
anything in the world that you want, as long as 
you get others what they want.” 
 
I truly believe in this wisdom, and so I want to 
help as many of my readers as I can. 
 
Wealth isn’t just transferred or stolen. Wealth is 
created. Every day more of it is created, by 
people who make the conscious effort to. 
 
I hope to create more wealth than I can possibly 
imagine. For myself, my family, my friends, my 
readers, my community, my country. 
 
And so I’ve offered all I can to get you started. 
 
What happens next is up to you.  
 
At no cost to you, I get paid a commission for 
referring you to the brokers listed above. Thanks 
for your support. Let’s create wealth together. 


